Marg Seufer

From: Rick Woodyard

Sent: Thursday, November 09, 2017 9:.06 AM
To: Marty Seufer

Subject: Fwd; IEI reimbursement request

Chief did not know how to charge for boat time
Asked that we take a look at that based on anything relative

Homeland Security - Emergency Management
Public Safety Telecommunications

Rick Woodyard, Director

FBI/NA 183

Wood County, WV

Office: (304) 420-0911

Email: rwoodyard@woodcountywv.com

"This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to
whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error please notify the system manager. This message
contains confidential information and is intended only for the individual named. If you are not the named addressee you
should not disseminate, distribute or copy thisemail.Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received
this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system. If you are not the intended recipient you are notified
that disclosing, copying, distributing or taking any action in reliance on the contents of this information is strictly
prohibited."

Begin forwarded message:

From: Charles Durham [ll <chiefdurham@mariettach.net>

Date: November 9, 2017 at 9:02:15 AM EST

To: "rwoodvard@woodcountywy.com” <rwoodvard@woodcountywy.com>
Ce: "Sherri J. Hess" <sherrihess@mariettach.net>

Subject: |El reimbursement request

Good morning,
Marietta Fire Department incurred the following expenses for the incident at the old Ames facility, {EL

$8,585.94 in personnel costs
79 hours of time for Fire Boat 1

Thank you in advance for your assistance with this matter. Please contact me if you require additional
information or a breakdown of personnel costs.

Sincerely,
Chief C.W. Durham 111

Marietta Fire Department
301 Putnam Street




Marietta, OH 45750
740-376-6444 office
740-525-9520 cell
740-373-1644 fax
hitp:/Awww.martettach.net
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message was scanned for virus infections by a Barracuda Networks SPAM/VIRUS filter. This
message and its attachments were scanned prior to leaving the City of Marietta's e-mail system.
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